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Bid Tabulation - # 050-13 Submersible Well Water Pumps and Motors
1 2 3 4a 4b 5 6 7 8 9 10 11 12
TOTAL PROMPT
PUMP MOTOR PUMP MOTOR @ MOTOR PUMP MOTOR PUMP MOTOR PUMP MOTOR PUMP MOTOR @ COST OF PAY
PER PER PER PER PER PER PER PER PER PER PER PER PER 1 EACH TERMS:
SECTION SECTION SECTION SECTION SECTION SECTION SECTION SECTION SECTION SECTION SECTION SECTION SECTION OFALL % ’
1.1 2 1.2 2 2 1.3 2 1.4 2 1.4 2 1.4 2 ITEMS DAYS
LISTED
Unit Cost Unit Cost Unit Cost Unit Cost Unit Cost Unit Cost Unit Cost Unit Cost Unit Cost Unit Cost Unit Cost Unit Cost Unit Cost
Naples
1 Armature
Works No Bid $1,870.00 No Bid $2,389.00 $1,870.00 No Bid $5,840.00 No Bid $6,695.00 No Bid $9,039.00 No Bid $10,520.00 $38,223.00 No Bid
Coast
2 Pump &
Supply $5,834.00 $2,162.00 $6,632.00 $2,625.00 $2,625.00 $11,061.00 $6,124.00 $11,828.00 $6,886.00 $15,379.00 $8,875.00 $14,424.00 $10,759.00 $105,214.00 N/A
Hudson
3 Pump &
Equipment $7,172.00 $2,798.00 $8,340.00 @ $3,403.00 $3,403.00 $10,466.00 $7,973.00 $15,100.00 $8,968.00 $13,170.00 $12,139.00 $13,170.00 $14,025.00 $120,127.00 No Bid
D&D
4 Machine &
Hydraulics No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
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